

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON
FOR THE COUNTY OF MULTNOMAH

In re:)	
)	Case No. 19CV54124
GRIDWORKS LAB, INC., an Oregon)	
corporation,)	
)	
)	RECEIVER’S NOTICE OF INTENT TO
)	COMPENSATE SUSSMAN SHANK LLP,
)	ATTORNEYS FOR RECEIVER
Petitioner.)	
)	

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN pursuant to ORS 37.170 and 37.310(6) and paragraph 8 of the Stipulated Order Appointing Receiver entered in the above-referenced case, that Clyde A. Hamstreet & Associates, LLC, Receiver, intends to compensate Sussman Shank LLP for services rendered to the Receiver and costs incurred for the period from March 1, 2020 through March 31, 2020. Attached hereto as Exhibit 1 is Sussman Shank LLP’s itemized statement of fees and costs incurred in connection with this matter for that time period, totaling \$29,846.50 in fees and \$77.12 in costs and expenses for a total of \$29,923.62.

NOTICE IS FURTHER GIVEN that unless a written objection to the requested fees and costs is filed with the Multnomah County Circuit Court, 1021 SW 4th Avenue, Portland, Oregon 97204, within fourteen (14) days of the date of this notice, and a copy of the objection is served by first class mail upon: (1) Clyde A. Hamstreet & Associates, LLC , Receiver, c/o Maren Cohn, One S.W. Columbia St., Suite 1575, Portland, Oregon 97204, and (2) Susan S. Ford and Sussman Shank LLP, the Receiver’s attorneys, 1000 S.W. Broadway, Suite 1400, Portland, Oregon 97205., the

1 Receiver will pay the amounts set forth on Exhibit 1 without further notice or hearing. If an
2 objection is timely filed, the Court will schedule a hearing to determine the objection.

3 Dated this 13th day of April, 2020.

4 SUSSMAN SHANK LLP

5 By: *s/ Susan S. Ford*

6 _____
Susan S. Ford, OSB No. 842203

7 sford@sussmanshank.com

8 Counsel for Clyde A. Hamstreet & Associates, LLC, Receiver

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

*22537-003\RECEIVER'S NOTICE OF INTENT TO COMPENSATE SLLP (MARCH 2020) (03431203);1

23

24

25

26

SUSSMAN SHANK ^{LLP}

ATTORNEYS

1000 SW Broadway, Suite 1400 | Portland, Oregon 97205

main 503.227.1111 or 800.352.7078 | fax 503.248.0130

SUSSMANSHANK.COM

CLYDE A. HAMSTREET & ASSOCIATES, LLC
Clyde A. Hamstreet
One SW Columbia
Suite 1000
Portland, OR 97258

April 10, 2020

Client ID 22537-003 SSF
Invoice No. 86790

Statement for period March 01, 2020 through March 31, 2020

LEGAL SERVICES REGARDING: GridWorks Receivership

Fees	T.K.	Hours	Amount
03/03/20 Review email from Maren Cohn regarding Gridworks financial statements and consider how to deal with December payments; reply to email; review emails regarding status of Paradigm and possible meeting by Maren with counsel regarding settlement	SSF	0.40	\$210.00
03/05/20 Review and analyze email from Maren Cohn regarding third party claim of Paradigm and possible meeting to resolve same by settlement	SSF	0.20	\$105.00
03/09/20 Review case status and multiple emails received and draft and send detailed email regarding same to Maren Cohn and Clyde Hamstreet dealing with claims issues with third parties, dash cam sale; sale of assets free and clear of liens and need for Court order to proceed (not just notice) issue of recovery of payments from state for rides provided; multiple additional operational issues ; including approximately 26 emails from creditors IRCO an AMR, client, and responding to same; coordinate follow up on all issues with client, Tom Stilley	SSF	2.80	\$1,470.00
Review email from Global Medical transportation and research service information for American Medical Transportation; Draft and send detailed response with supporting documents	MPR	0.60	\$120.00
Analyze correspondence from IRCO and scan and email to Maren for follow up	MPR	0.20	\$40.00
03/10/20 Attend to multiple tasks and issues in Gridworks including Motion to Sell, timing of same and analysis of ex parte appearance for approval to proceed prior to expiration of 14 day notice period; coordination of draft of motion and order with Majesta Racanelli(.7); emails with Maren Cohn regarding employee who refuses to allow receiver access to AWS account (.2); emails regarding auction list(.2); email and coordination of health care attorney regarding February rides owed by state(.1)	SSF	1.20	\$630.00
Draft Notice of Intent to compensate receivership for February 2020 and prepare exhibits and draft Notice of intent to compensate Sussman Shank for February 2020, request statement from Accounting	MPR	0.70	\$140.00
Email from and to Maren regarding Motion to sell assets free and clear and missing documents	MPR	0.30	\$60.00
Draft Motion and Declaration in Support to Sell Assets Free and Clear of Liens	MPR	0.80	\$160.00

SUSSMAN SHANK LLP

ATTORNEYS

1000 SW Broadway, Suite 1400 | Portland, Oregon 97205

main 503.227.1111 or 800.352.7078 | fax 503.248.0130

SUSSMANSHANK.COM

CLYDE A. HAMSTREET & ASSOCIATES, LLC
Clyde A. Hamstreet
One SW Columbia
Suite 1000
Portland, OR 97258

April 10, 2020

Client ID 22537-003 SSF
Invoice No. 86790

Fees		T.K.	Hours	Amount
03/11/20	Telephone conversation with Maren Cohn regarding notice procedures for auction; meeting with paralegal Majesta Racanelli regarding same and obtaining consent of notice parties; telephone conversation with Maren Cohn regarding issues with obtaining access to websites and difficulties with former employee regarding helping to obtain access	TWS	0.30	\$157.50
	Review and consider e-mails from Maren Cohn regarding sale of property, abandonment of property, and access to IT accounts; telephone conversation with Maren Cohn regarding same; draft motion to sell and abandon assets; meeting with paralegal Majesta Racanelli regarding same	TWS	2.50	\$1,312.50
	Draft and send email to attorney Thomas Stilley with Notice and exhibits for review and approval regarding intent to compensate for February 2020	MPR	0.20	\$40.00
	Continued revisions and drafting of Motion to Sell Assets and Declaration of Clyde Hamstreet	MPR	0.80	\$160.00
03/12/20	Review 3 emails from Maren Cohn regarding third party claims, issue with AWS and former employee; unwanted assets	SSF	0.30	\$157.50
	E-mail correspondence with Maren Cohn regarding motion to sell personal property at auction and abandon property of inconsequential value (.5); review and revise motion and work with Maren Cohn on further revisions (1.2); review and revise declaration of Clyde Hamstreet in support (.5); e-mail correspondence with Maren Cohn regarding abandonment issue and payment of personal property taxes from sale proceeds (.2); review and revise motion and declaration (.3);	TWS	2.70	\$1,417.50
03/13/20	Review and revise motion to sell and abandon property; e-mails to and from Maren Cohn regarding same; e-mails to and from Joe Van Leuven regarding consent to sale and questions regarding software that is not being sold; e-mails from and to Ross Peterson regarding consent to sale and abandonment; e-mail to Maren Cohn regarding software issues and privacy concerns if software is sold	TWS	1.50	\$787.50
	E-mail from Joe Van Leuven regarding personally identifiable information; e-mail to and from Maren Cohn regarding same and e-mail to Joe Van Leuven regarding protections being take to wipe all computers of personal information	TWS	0.20	\$105.00
	Research email addresses for Ross Peterson and Greg Kelminson; voice mail message and telephone call with Ross Peterson to verify email address; voice mail message and telephone call with Greg Kelminson to verify email address	KAM	0.70	\$147.00

SUSSMAN SHANK LLP

ATTORNEYS

1000 SW Broadway, Suite 1400 | Portland, Oregon 97205

main 503.227.1111 or 800.352.7078 | fax 503.248.0130

SUSSMANSHANK.COM

CLYDE A. HAMSTREET & ASSOCIATES, LLC
Clyde A. Hamstreet
One SW Columbia
Suite 1000
Portland, OR 97258

April 10, 2020

Client ID 22537-003 SSF
Invoice No. 86790

Fees	T.K.	Hours	Amount
03/16/20 Review email from client with list of 5 issues; confer with Tom Stilley regarding status of same; email Majesta Racanelli regarding Notices for compensation of professionals; analyze issue of filing claims with the state for rides reimbursement and discuss same with healthcare attorney Jack Caynon; investigation of court access for stipulated Sale Motion and Order; detailed response email to Maren Cohn regarding all the above; coordination with Majesta Racanelli regarding court appearance ex parte procedure resulting from Health Emergency for court hearing on Sale Motion	SSF	1.50	\$787.50
Review e-mail from Greg Kelminson with AMR regarding abandonment of burdensome property; e-mail to Maren Cohn regarding obtaining a general description of property to be abandoned	TWS	0.20	\$105.00
E-mails to and from counsel for creditors regarding consent to motion to sell assets and abandon property (.2); e-mail to and from Maren Cohn regarding same (.1); review and revise motion and declaration of Clyde Hamstreet in support, and draft order granting motion (.5); e-mails to and from legal assistant Janine Hume and paralegal Majesta Racanelli regarding finalizing and filing motion or taking to Ex Parte to obtain order approving motion (.2)	TWS	1.00	\$525.00
E-mail from and to attorney Susan Ford regarding IT access issues needing follow up	TWS	0.10	\$52.50
Review of Gridwork reimbursement issue from CareOregon	JLC	0.50	\$200.00
Draft and send email to Maren regarding approval of Sussman's fee Statement	MPR	0.20	\$40.00
Telephone call to Multnomah County regarding Ex Parte Appearance and Motion to Sell	MPR	0.30	\$60.00
Finalize and email to Clyde Declaration in Support to be reviewed and signed	MPR	0.40	\$80.00
Draft certificate of service and finalize Sussman Shank and Clyde A. Hamstreet Notice of Intent to Compensate and file with court	MPR	0.80	\$160.00

SUSSMAN SHANK LLP

ATTORNEYS

1000 SW Broadway, Suite 1400 | Portland, Oregon 97205

main 503.227.1111 or 800.352.7078 | fax 503.248.0130

SUSSMANSHANK.COM

CLYDE A. HAMSTREET & ASSOCIATES, LLC
Clyde A. Hamstreet
One SW Columbia
Suite 1000
Portland, OR 97258

April 10, 2020

Client ID 22537-003 SSF
Invoice No. 86790

Fees	T.K.	Hours	Amount
03/17/20 Review and analyze Motion to Sell Assets/Abandon Property and Declaration of Clyde Hamstreet and proposed Order and certification of counsel in preparation for e-filing; revise Order to reflect actual date of notice provided to Health Share and Special Notice Parties; coordinate regarding ex parte appearance per courts instructions to Majesta Racanelli(.7) ; 2 telephone calls to court for ex parte appearance, leaving messages; email status update to client and review her reply; further reply to client(.2); telephone call from Katlynn Backus, clerk to Judge Bushong regarding afternoon ex parte appearance option and instructions for emailing pleadings to court: coordination of same (.7); Telephonic appearance at ex parte and obtain entry of Order permitting sale and abandonment; update to client regarding same (.6)	SSF	2.20	\$1,155.00
Review/analyze emails between Maren Cohn and Tom Stilley regarding procedure to obtain access to AWS account and Gavin's refusal to cooperate with receiver; discussion with Tom Stilley regarding utilizing show cause process for violation of receivership order instead of subpoena process; further review of forwarded emails regarding Amazon and discussion of strategy with Tom Stilley	SSF	0.70	\$367.50
Review and analyze issues in email forwarded by Maren Cohn regarding third party claims; email to Joe VanLeuven to coordinate meeting to discuss Health Share's position	SSF	0.30	\$157.50
Review emails/attachments from Maren Cohn regarding February ride claims and coordinate with Jack Caynon; review emails from HealthShare attorney and Tom Stilley regarding dealing with Microsoft and Gavin employee issue/possible order to show cause	SSF	0.30	\$157.50
E-mails from and to Joe Van Leuven regarding obtaining access to Microsoft AWS account; e-mail to Maren Cohn regarding same	TWS	0.10	\$52.50
E-mail from Maren Cohn regarding the possibility of sending a subpoena to Amazon to obtain login information for AWS account	TWS	0.10	\$52.50
E-mail correspondence with Maren Cohn, Health Share's counsel, and attorney Susan Ford regarding information need and procedure for obtaining access to Amazon AWS accounts; draft motion for order requiring Amazon to replace current designee and replace him with the Receiver for access to the accounts	TWS	2.20	\$1,155.00
Review email from client on submitting costs to Medicaid	JLC	0.20	\$80.00
Draft certificate of service and certificate of readiness and finalize order and file documents with court for Ex Parte	MPR	0.80	\$160.00

SUSSMAN SHANK LLP

ATTORNEYS

1000 SW Broadway, Suite 1400 | Portland, Oregon 97205

main 503.227.1111 or 800.352.7078 | fax 503.248.0130

SUSSMANSHANK.COM

CLYDE A. HAMSTREET & ASSOCIATES, LLC
Clyde A. Hamstreet
One SW Columbia
Suite 1000
Portland, OR 97258

April 10, 2020

Client ID 22537-003 SSF
Invoice No. 86790

Fees	T.K.	Hours	Amount
03/17/20 Confer with attorney Susan Ford and revise Certificate of Readiness and refile Ex Parte order	MPR	0.30	\$60.00
03/18/20 Review emails and motion prepared by Tom Stilley regarding removal of Singh from amazon web account and compelling AWS to comply; provide comments to Tom Stilley; update to Ingrid Brydolf	SSF	0.60	\$315.00
Draft motion to require Amazon Web Services to grant Receiver access to AWS accounts; review information from Maren Cohn and incorporate into motion and declaration in support; e-mail to attorney Susan Ford and paralegal Majesta Racanelli regarding revised motion and declaration and preparation of exhibits	TWS	2.50	\$1,312.50
Analyze and revise draft motion for turnover of information regarding Amazon account; Draft shell for declaration and email to attorney Thomas Stilley and attorney Susan Ford for further review	MPR	0.70	\$140.00
Review case docket for status of Order approving sale and email to attorney Susan Ford on Ex Parte instructions from hearing	MPR	0.30	\$60.00
Review and revise Motion and Declaration for Receiver to gain control of Amazon account and email to attorney Thomas Stilley and attorney Susan Ford follow up questions	MPR	0.80	\$160.00
Research Amazon Web Service, Inc. service information via Oregon Secretary of State and email to attorney Susan Ford and attorney Thomas Stilley service issues	MPR	0.60	\$120.00
Review comments from attorney Thomas Stilley on exhibits 1 and 2 for Maren Declaration and revise with additional correspondence	MPR	0.70	\$140.00
Finalize exhibits and mark and email to attorney Thomas Stilley and attorney Susan Ford for approval	MPR	0.20	\$40.00
03/19/20 Review and comment on Motion and Order and ex parte appearance requirements for requiring AWS to delete Singh and recognize Receiver's authority; discussion with Tom Stilley regarding procedure (.3); review further email from Joe Van Leuven regarding records retention questions; discussion with Tom Stilley and follow up with Maren Cohn regarding same(.4)	SSF	0.70	\$367.50
E-mail correspondence with paralegal Majesta Racanelli and attorney Susan Ford regarding procedure for appearing at Ex Parte under Court's new remote appearance rules; draft letter to AWS General Counsel regarding motion and requesting assistance; e-mails from and to Ingrid Brydolf regarding status	TWS	1.50	\$787.50

SUSSMAN SHANK^{LLP}

ATTORNEYS

1000 SW Broadway, Suite 1400 | Portland, Oregon 97205

main 503.227.1111 or 800.352.7078 | fax 503.248.0130

SUSSMANSHANK.COM

CLYDE A. HAMSTREET & ASSOCIATES, LLC
Clyde A. Hamstreet
One SW Columbia
Suite 1000
Portland, OR 97258

April 10, 2020

Client ID 22537-003 SSF
Invoice No. 86790

Fees	T.K.	Hours	Amount
03/19/20 Draft letter to Anil Singh regarding Ex Parte appearance regarding motion to shorten time	TWS	0.20	\$105.00
Review and revise motion to shorten time and proposed order; finalize letters to AWS and Anil Singh	TWS	0.50	\$262.50
Various e-mails from and to paralegal Majesta Racanelli regarding finalizing pleadings, notice requirements, and service issues	TWS	0.50	\$262.50
Telephone conversation with attorney Susan Ford regarding retention of GridWorks' records	TWS	0.20	\$105.00
Review and analyze correspondence to Anil Singh and Amazon World Services regarding access to account	JES	0.10	\$32.00
Analyze Multnomah County Website and review Ex Parte procedures; email to attorney Thomas Stilley and attorney Susan Ford information	MPR	0.30	\$60.00
Review Multnomah County Local Rules on Ex Parte and draft Motion to Shorten time for Motion Requiring Amazon to Remove Designee and email to attorney Thomas Stilley and attorney Susan Ford for review	MPR	0.60	\$120.00
Telephone call to David Zapolsky regarding Motion for Ex Parte, left detailed message; Research additional contact information for David	MPR	0.40	\$80.00
Telephone call to Multnomah County Presiding Judge chambers to confer on Ex Parte Procedures and call in information	MPR	0.30	\$60.00
Analyze court ECF Notices accepting filings; download documents and email to Maren file stamped copies	MPR	0.30	\$60.00
Finalize Motion, Declaration with Exhibits, and proposed order and email to Maren for review and signature	MPR	0.60	\$120.00
Revise declaration of Maren Cohn with requested changes and resend for signature	MPR	0.30	\$60.00
Finalize letter to Davd Z, in house counsel for Amazon Web Services with Motion, Order and Exhibits and email	MPR	0.50	\$100.00
Finalize letter to Anil Singh , in house counsel for Amazon Web Services with Motion, Order and Exhibits and email	MPR	0.50	\$100.00
Draft Certificate of service and Certificate of Readiness and finalize Motion, Proposed order with Exhibits for Ex Parte and serve on Court Clerk;	MPR	0.60	\$120.00
Draft and end service copy of Ex Parte Motion to shorten time to requested parties notice	MPR	0.10	\$20.00

SUSSMAN SHANK LLP

ATTORNEYS

1000 SW Broadway, Suite 1400 | Portland, Oregon 97205

main 503.227.1111 or 800.352.7078 | fax 503.248.0130

SUSSMANSHANK.COM

CLYDE A. HAMSTREET & ASSOCIATES, LLC
Clyde A. Hamstreet
One SW Columbia
Suite 1000
Portland, OR 97258

April 10, 2020

Client ID 22537-003 SSF
Invoice No. 86790

Fees	T.K.	Hours	Amount
03/20/20 Identify issues for discussion in email from HealthShare attorney Joe VanLeuven; telephone call to Maren Cohn regarding same, leaving message(.2); telephone conference with Maren Cohn to review multiple issues and discuss resolution with HealthShare and through documentation in Order Discharging Receiver (1.0)	SSF	1.20	\$630.00
Attend Ex Parte to obtain order on motion shortening time (.6); telephone conversation with Tad Kaburaki, attorney for AWS regarding the parties entering into a stipulated order regarding the AWS accounts (.4); e-mail to client regarding same (.1)	TWS	1.10	\$577.50
Telephone call to Presiding Judge Chambers regarding confirmation of receipt of documents for Ex Parte	MPR	0.20	\$40.00
Draft certificate of service and certificate of readiness for Motion and Declaration in support and proposed order authorizing Amazon to remove Anil Singh and finalize and file documents	MPR	0.70	\$140.00
03/23/20 Telephone conference call with Tom Stilley regarding sale and conference with Maren regarding remaining receivership tasks and issues(.4); review and analyze sale order, notes of conference with Maren, and Receivership order and develop plan for wrapping up receivership, identification of issues and methods for possible resolution (2.6); draft and revise extensive email to Maren Cohn and Clyde Hamstreet regarding plan for last stages of receivership and contents of Order terminating receivership and discharging receiver (1.2)	SSF	4.20	\$2,205.00
03/24/20 Review and analyze several emails from Maren Cohn regarding multiple issues regarding "missing" property identified by Ingrid Brydorf and regarding records retention issues; reply to Maren Cohn; follow up with Tom Stilley regarding same; coordination of conference call regarding claim issues between receiver and health care attorney Jack Caynon	SSF	0.70	\$367.50
E-mail correspondence with Ingrid Brydorf regarding AWS accounts and access to information and location of equipment; e-mail to and from Maren Cohn regarding same; e-mail from and to Maren Cohn regarding location of computer equipment	TWS	0.50	\$262.50
Call with client regarding certification of trips for Medicaid purposes	JLC	0.30	\$120.00

SUSSMAN SHANK LLP

ATTORNEYS

1000 SW Broadway, Suite 1400 | Portland, Oregon 97205

main 503.227.1111 or 800.352.7078 | fax 503.248.0130

SUSSMANSHANK.COM

CLYDE A. HAMSTREET & ASSOCIATES, LLC
Clyde A. Hamstreet
One SW Columbia
Suite 1000
Portland, OR 97258

April 10, 2020

Client ID 22537-003 SSF
Invoice No. 86790

Fees	T.K.	Hours	Amount
03/25/20 Request and analyze HealthShare/GridWorks contracts requested from Maren Cohn regarding records retention issues upon termination of contract (.6); review additional multiple emails regarding receivership administration issues and questions posed by Ingrid Brydolf attorney for HealthShare regarding alleged missing items of equipment personal property, weekly reporting, and records retention issues (.9); telephone conference call with Thomas Stilley regarding same and next steps (.4); review and analyze email from Maren Cohn regarding allegedly missing property; email to Ingrid Brydolf with detailed update regarding same (.5); further follow up with Maren Cohn on weekly report issue and records proposal made by HealthShare; coordinate telephone call for followup (.4); telephone status conference with Maren Cohn (.7)	SSF	3.50	\$1,837.50
Review e-mails from Ingrid Brydolf regarding computer equipment, retention of records, and financial information and discuss same with attorney Susan Ford	TWS	0.60	\$315.00
Telephone conversation with Mike Guerin, attorney for AWS, regarding termination of AWS leases, payment, and transition issues to Health Share	TWS	0.30	\$157.50
Review notice from court regarding documents accepted; download court stamped documents for file and draft and send email to Maren Cohn copies.	MPR	0.50	\$100.00
03/26/20 Review and analyze 3 emails received regarding records retention and data issues; draft proposed response to question regarding records retention as between HealthShare and GridWorks, regarding Receiver's position and send to client and Tom Stilley for review and comment; review further email from Ross Peterson regarding intent to retain counsel to review HS proposed agreement and reply to Maren with recommendations; further emails with Maren Cohn regarding finalizing receivers position regarding records retention and receive and review Maren Cohn proposed changes to draft email; finalize and send email to HealthShare Counsel and Peterson for GridWorks	SSF	1.80	\$945.00
Email with Maren Cohn regarding lease and intent to vacate premises after April 1 and prorated rent; review email from Aleks Vold and request attachment from Maren Cohn regarding data breach claim issue; review and respond to email from Ingrid Brydolf regarding records issue	SSF	0.30	\$157.50
Review e-mails from attorney Susan Ford and review and provide comments to proposed response to Health Share and Ross regarding retention of records issues	TWS	0.20	\$105.00

SUSSMAN SHANK LLP

ATTORNEYS

1000 SW Broadway, Suite 1400 | Portland, Oregon 97205

main 503.227.1111 or 800.352.7078 | fax 503.248.0130

SUSSMANSHANK.COM

CLYDE A. HAMSTREET & ASSOCIATES, LLC
Clyde A. Hamstreet
One SW Columbia
Suite 1000
Portland, OR 97258

April 10, 2020

Client ID 22537-003 SSF
Invoice No. 86790

Fees	T.K.	Hours	Amount
03/27/20 Coordination of meeting with Aleks Vold and Maren Cohn; review documents in advance of conference call and brief analysis of application of automatic stay and receiver's vs. GridWorks role(.5); attend to conference call with Baker Hostettler attorneys, Maren Cohn and Ross Peterson regarding next steps for GridWorks response to inquiry(.3); notes to file and calendar followup (.2); telephone conference with Maren Cohn regarding (a) role of Ross Peterson and compensation for cooperating in providing information and answers to regulatory inquiry to GridWorks insurance counsel; and (b) Lease question regarding security deposit and any potential to recovery any portion from landlord(.4)	SSF	1.40	\$735.00
03/29/20 Commence review of Lease provisions regarding security deposit issue	SSF	0.30	\$157.50
03/30/20 Analyze provisions of office lease and two amendments regarding possible recovery of portion of security deposit as debt owed to Receivership; analyze Receivership Code provisions regarding executory contracts and ORS 37.140; detailed email to Maren Cohn with recommendation to request repayment of security deposit after negotiating with landlord regarding payment of April prorated rent and cleaning /refurbishing fees(1.5); review deadline for objections to Notices of Intent to Compensate for February fees; coordination of notice with Majesta Racanelli for March (.2)	SSF	1.70	\$892.50
Review letter regarding " Inquiry" into data breach and research duties of Receiver vs. Owner to respond to inquiry and jurisdictional issues; draft email for Aleks Vold to send to Oregon Dept of Consumer and Business Affairs regarding role of Receiver vs. GridWorks in responding to the Inquiry; send email to Maren Cohn for review and comments; review comments received from Maren	SSF	1.30	\$682.50
Review and analyze outstanding receivership activities and items to be completed prior to termination; identify deadlines and items for discussion and follow up with Receiver	SSF	0.20	\$105.00
Review email from attorney Susan Ford and accounting on Statement for noticing and follow up on date range	MPR	0.20	\$40.00
Email to attorney Susan Ford with notice of intent to compensate from February	MPR	0.20	\$40.00
03/31/20 Telephone conference call with Maren Cohn regarding analysis of security deposit, clarification of size of deposit and Receiver's ability to require turnover or collect a debt owed to gridWorks, and differences from possible bankruptcy outcomes; review further email from Maren Cohn regarding same	SSF	0.40	\$210.00

SUSSMAN SHANK LLP

ATTORNEYS

1000 SW Broadway, Suite 1400 | Portland, Oregon 97205

main 503.227.1111 or 800.352.7078 | fax 503.248.0130

SUSSMANSHANK.COM

CLYDE A. HAMSTREET & ASSOCIATES, LLC
 Clyde A. Hamstreet
 One SW Columbia
 Suite 1000
 Portland, OR 97258

April 10, 2020

Client ID 22537-003 SSF
 Invoice No. 86790

Fees	T.K.	Hours	Amount
03/31/20 Telephone conference with Maren Cohn regarding her meeting with HealthShare and receipt of directives to exclude Ross Peterson and turnover of records; issues with HealthShare lack of understanding of role of Receiver; review emails regarding same; confer with attorney Tom Stilley regarding management of issue; emails to attorney Joe VanLeuven requesting meeting regarding same; review reply and respond by forwarding HealthShare follow up emails subsequent to meeting; set time for conference; update to Maren Cohn	SSF	1.50	\$787.50
Review email from Maren Cohn approving draft response for use by Aleks Vold in response to Oregon dept of Business and Consumer Affairs Inquiry; make final revisions to response and send to Aleks Vold	SSF	0.50	\$262.50
Telephone conversation with attorney Susan Ford regarding records retention issues	TWS	0.30	\$157.50
Analyze court docket and verify no objections to notice of intent; draft and send email to Maren with courtesy copies for payment	MPR	0.40	\$80.00

Timekeeper Recap

T.K.	Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
SSF	FORD, SUSAN S.	30.20	\$525.00	\$15,855.00
TWS	STILLEY, THOMAS W.	19.30	\$525.00	\$10,132.50
JLC	CAYNON, JACK L.	1.00	\$400.00	\$400.00
JES	STEWART, JESSE C.	0.10	\$320.00	\$32.00
KAM	MOODY, KATHY A.	0.70	\$210.00	\$147.00
MPR	RACANELLI, MAJESTA P.	16.40	\$200.00	\$3,280.00

TOTAL FEES **\$29,846.50**

COSTS AND EXPENSES **Amount**

03/09/20 CSC CORPORATE SERVICES \$36.00

SUSSMAN SHANK^{LLP}

ATTORNEYS

1000 SW Broadway, Suite 1400 | Portland, Oregon 97205

main 503.227.1111 or 800.352.7078 | fax 503.248.0130

SUSSMANSHANK.COM

CLYDE A. HAMSTREET & ASSOCIATES, LLC
Clyde A. Hamstreet
One SW Columbia
Suite 1000
Portland, OR 97258

April 10, 2020

Client ID 22537-003 SSF
Invoice No. 86790

COSTS AND EXPENSES		Amount
03/31/20	Duplicating Expenses	\$31.20
	Facsimiles Sent	N/C
	Long Distance Telephone	\$0.12
	Postage	\$9.80
TOTAL COSTS AND EXPENSES		\$77.12
TOTAL FEES AND COSTS		\$29,923.62

PRIOR STATEMENT BALANCE	\$13,038.26
TOTAL PAYMENTS AND ADJUSTMENTS	-\$13,038.26
CURRENT CHARGES	\$29,923.62
PAY THIS AMOUNT	\$29,923.62

Any Payments Received After 04/10/20 Will Appear on Your Next Statement

TRUST/RETAINER ACCOUNTING

Date	Check No.	Description	Amount
		Prior Trust Balance	\$0.00
04/07/20	WIRE	Deposit in Trust- Gridworks Lab Inc-	\$13,038.26
04/08/20	7603	Apply Trust to A/R	-\$13,038.26
		BALANCE IN TRUST/RETAINER	\$0.00

SUSSMAN SHANK LLP

ATTORNEYS

1000 SW Broadway, Suite 1400 | Portland, Oregon 97205

main 503.227.1111 or 800.352.7078 | fax 503.248.0130

SUSSMANSHANK.COM

CLYDE A. HAMSTREET & ASSOCIATES, LLC
Clyde A. Hamstreet
One SW Columbia
Suite 1000
Portland, OR 97258

April 10, 2020

Client ID 22537-003 SSF
Invoice No. 86790

Detail of Payments and Adjustments

Date	Check No.	Description	Amount
04/10/20	7603	Apply Trust	\$13,038.26

- Receive your statement electronically:
Contact: AccountingGroup@sussmanshank.com
- We accept Visa, MasterCard, Discover & Amex
- Pay online at: sussmanshank.com/PayMyStatement
- We appreciate your business -----

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I hereby certify that on April 13, 2020 I caused to be served a full and exact copy of the foregoing **RECEIVER NOTICE OF INTENT TO COMPENSATE SUSSMAN SHANK LLP, ATTORNEYS FOR RECEIVER** on the following persons:

Douglas Paul Perkins Coie LLP 1120 N.W. Couch Street, 10 th Floor Portland, OR 97206 Attorneys for Petitioner GridWorks Lab, Inc.	Joseph M. VanLeuven Davis Wright Tremaine LLLP 1300 S.W. Fifth Ave., St. 2400 Portland, OR 97201 Attorneys for Health Share of Oregon
C. Ross Peterson GridWorks Lab, Inc. 625 S.W. Broadway, Suite 300 Portland, OR 97205 Interested Party	Kimberley Hanks McGair Farleigh Wada Witt 121 SW Morrison Street, Suite 600 Portland, OR 97204 Attorneys for First Transit, Inc.

by the following indicated method(s):

- First Class Mail, postage prepaid, deposited in the US mail at Portland, OR
- Hand delivery
- Facsimile transmission
- Overnight delivery
- Email
- Electronic filing notification

Dated: April 13, 2020

s/ Susan S. Ford
Susan S. Ford, OSB No. 842203